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Consolidated Financial Performance: 2022 

 

In 2022, TV Thunder Public Company Limited ("the Company"), had a total revenue of 308.43 million 
Baht, an increase of 8.15 million Baht or 3% compared to the previous year. Although revenue from 
advertising business decreased by 45.51 million Baht due to gradually decrease of advertising market 
values, the Company was still able to generate an additional revenue of 54.63 million Baht from service 
business. It was mainly from drama/series production service that were delivered within the year, an 
increase of 46.01 million Baht compared to the previous year. In addition, revenue from other services 
such as studio services, public relation events, and drama/series licensing management also 
contributed to the increased revenue. 

In 2022, the Company had a total cost of 228.76 million Baht, an increase of 33.21 million Baht or 17% 
compared to the previous year, It was mainly due to increased costs from drama/TV production 
service, sales of new series copyrights, and public relation events, resulting in increased overall costs 
from service business of 51.25 million Baht. 

In 2022, the Company had total expenses of 91.95 million Baht, a decrease of 2.43 million Baht or 3% 
compared to the previous year. It was mainly due to an increase of unrealized loss on investment in 
mutual funds amounted to 10.02 million Baht which affected by world economy conditions even 
though the cost of distribution was reduced by 5.16 million Baht compared to the previous year. 

Aforementioned, the company reported a net loss of 9.67 million Baht in 2022, a decrease in net profit 
from the previous year of 32.26 million Baht, a decrease in profit from the advertising business group 
of 27.98 million Baht compared to the previous year because some customers in the advertising 
business were affected by an increased of CPI and operating costs, causing them to reduce their 
advertising spending. In addition, in 2021, the company recognized a profit from reverse loss on 
diminution value of land and buildings of 7.72 million Baht. 
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As of December 31, 2022, the company's total financial position was 672.05 million Baht, a decrease 
of 71.97 million Baht compared to the previous year. This was due to a decrease in inventory of 32.30 
million Baht from dramas/series that began production in 2021 and were delivered in 2022, as well as 
a decrease in other current financial assets of 31.36 million Baht from the sale of investment in mutual 
funds of 21.34 million Baht and recognition of a loss from the revaluation of assets of 10.02 million 
Baht. These funds were used as working capital to support the increased production of dramas and 
series, as well as to pay trade payables in accordance with normal credit terms. 

 

 

The financial ratios are presented as follows. 

 
 


